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Online Only Auction

STARTS: TUESDAY - FEBRUARY 8, 2022 - 12:00 PM
ENDS: TUESDAY - FEBRUARY 15, 2022 - 1:00 PM
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Auctioneer/Realtor®

WILLIAM H. GILL JR.
330-418-8727
billgill@kikocompany.com

PICKUP:  
THURSDAY - FEBRUARY 17, 2022 – 3:00-6:00 PM

SHIPPING: For shipping, contact The UPS Store 
#6658 in Wadsworth, OH at 330-594-2463. You 
can also email your invoice to  
store6658@theupsstore.com. A minimum  
pickup fee of $20 will be charged by The UPS Store 
in addition to packing and shipping charges. Insured 
shipments of coins or currency may be subject to 
additional costs.

1950S & OTHER FURNITURE - LAMPS: Herman 
Miller chair, brass & glass table attributed to Milo 
Baughman, Eames Eiffel Tower chair, 1950s lamps, 
Yasha Heifetz lamp, Quoizel leaded shade lamp, 
Victorian hanging lamp, 1920s chinoiserie  
telephone stand, barrister bookcase, fancy  
octagonal table by Johnson Handley, set of four 
1970s Rowland chairs, gold leaf foyer table.
JEWELRY: Fine Estate & costume jewelry, 14K & 
18K gold, diamonds, gemstones, pearls, sterling 
silver, Technomarine watch.

ART & ANTIQUES: Original art, folk art, Italian  
watercolor, etchings, prints, art glass, pottery,  
Roseville, Rookwood, antique dolls, old quilts,  
celluloid boxes, antique clothing buttons, vintage 
clothing, ladies perfumes, books, vintage car  
advertising, arrowheads, 1990s Godzilla toys,  
marbles, alabaster bust, canes, gentlemen’s  
collectibles, revolving store display for hardware, & 
more!         

TERMS: Visa, MasterCard & Wire Transfer  
accepted. 15% buyer’s premium on all sales.  
Information is believed to be accurate but not  
guaranteed. Multi Par auction process may be used.


